. N - .
- . R
_rﬁmg% T BTEP-33004/96 = Y\p " REGD. NO. D.1.-33004/96

JIId
Che Gazette of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY

W 0—0g 3—34-GE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

WIEHT | Werriira
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

7§ foeedt, dimar, faaeat 23, 1996w 2, 1918

e 436]
No. 436 ] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, DECEMBER 23, 1996/PAUSA 2, 1918
- o -

¥ faeedr, 23 feamr, 1996

) ar, w1 R 582( 1) —Iwis wedeRy Tog W wfafem, 1948 (1948 F34) H) W 95 T ST-UR (1) H
VAR, HHEK U A (FE) frm, 1950 F Wity w6 % e mi 1 TR, 1996 % WRA @ U9AOH, WRT-2,
WUE-3, IY-WOB (1) ¥ IR TCHR, A HHer 1 srfergaan g « A w1 . 507(37) i 31 FERpEs, 1996 B0 Hivag
ey e T frg o & fr 5wt iR @, et 3w wnfm @9 @ daree o, w3 en, e T
srferera W w5t 18 off, WYyl snd e ) swersy fig W ARt @ 45 T Y oy % o et ofk yaa
HqE Y & |

ik wrafa eRr TRTTT W wiaai S I w1 T, 1996 FH ITEre w6 T At

sty warfe F=Tg SR ¥ v dEu ® g sraftel stk el e w fam #

ST TR IR HTUPRTT T ¥ 95 T WEE WRTE! 1 W= FQ TUFHT WHR, HAa T st fore & syt
O % w5 FHER Tog #@ () Fraw, 1950 F ofk deitem w0 % fag Feafaton frem s @, st —

1. A T = Rt v s (R fiwfra St frem, 1996w e |
2. 4 Py 1 IR, 1997 | W E |
3, wAERt v A (w) fram, 1950 i —
(1) Fraw 50 qur ok wAH W A TR W) % TE W wer uiw | sl % wiearton faa s,
(2) PERs51H —
(1) v (F) ® I afim’ e % v w4y wfiwn ! vl ) wiaeenfin fmar s,
(2) wvg (T) H 'Y, gl el % wam w13, whra!! el Y et fee e,

3147 GI/96 M



2

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[Parr I—Ssc. 3(1)]

witrewr' ! el ¥ warr 9 1 3/4 wfoere ! weY w vt e e,
(3) PERs54 o, 9ot & —
(1) w9 FE 1 % e 96 T8 o T ey of ot ¥ v w96 TR ol wad wrfues AR 116

T @ " W) el &) wivemnf T s,

(2) " A 11 AR R daft wiafed % v Prefafan wm demd o afyfest s s . —

i

13.
14,
15.
16.
17,

18.

12.

116 T R ya@ Afum AfwT 126 ¥ @ w7
136 T 3R TEQ wAfirs AfeT 156 T | B9
156 T AR THY s AT 176 TR | w9
176 T AN TEQ Al A 196 TR ¥ &
196 T 3 vER sifers AT 216 T V
216 T ol woR ifbmh Siftd 236 T | %A
236 T 3N 7o HAfeR

63.00
73.00
83.00
93.00
103.00
113.00

125.00."'

[, T9-38025/28/94-TF. W, 1]
T HAR B, TG afom

urg feoquft ; —qem frael #) i & e F W2, wus-3, I9-uvE (i) ® W He T sifte S .
STR.3N.212 T 22-6-1950 3 Afugfem fva o ar i wma-wo R fFrafafen sfagsmet s
it far v e —

LU

N

o

10.
.
12.
13,
14.
15.
16.
17.

. Ta. AR, T 80 R 9-1-1960

W, TH. AR, HAT 1200 FEAH 27-9-1960
o, TH. AR T 594 AR 29-3-1963
Y, TH. AR, G 240 FATH 6-2-1964

oft. v, o T 1834 AT 18-12-1964
ft. wy. IR, weAT 474 fEIE 19-3-1965
W, T, AR T 1082 EAF 29-6-1966
. TH, AR FEA 545 RHTH 14-4-1967
o, TH. AR G 500 RAE 6-3-1968
A, wH. I w677 FEAH 29-3-1968
M. wH. R T 1106 A 22-5-1968
ot 79, SR T 2113 AR 28-11-1968
o, 1. AR H 306 e 7-3-1974
o, TE. SR g 1122 A 1-10-1974
oY, TE. AR WA 56 A 23-12-1976
ft. v, et w60 fEiw 5-1-1982

Y. T, SR [ 129 fEHiF 9-2-1987



[y H—9g 3(i)] LIRGRCI IR E RE I 1310 ) . 3

18, Sl TH. 3R, Y& 199 TEAF 6-3-1990
19, St ww, IR, ¥E@m 76 & 22-1-1991
20. S TH. AR, T 368 T 27-3-1992
21, S ", SR, GE&A 522 & 16-11-1996

MINISTRY OF LABOUR
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 23rd December, 1996

G. S. R. 582(E).—Whereas certain draft of rules further to amend the Employees' State Insurance (Central) Rules,
1950 were published as required under sub-section (1) ot section 95 of the ESY Act, 1948 (34 of 1948) in the notification of the
Government of India in the Ministry of Labour GSR. 507(E), dated the 31st October, 1996 in.the Gazette of India, Part-11
section 3, sub-section (1) dated 1st November, 1996 inviting suggestions and objections from all persons likely to be affected
thereby within a period of forty-five days from the date on which the copies of the Gazette in which the said notification was
published were made available to the public;

And whereas copies of the said Gazette were made available to the public on the 1st November, 1996;
And whereas the Central Government has considered the suggestions and objections received in this regard;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 95 of the said Act, the Central Government, after
consultation with the Employees' State Insurance Corporation hereby makes the following rules further to amend the’
employees' State Insurance (Contral) Rules, 1950 namely

1.  These rules may be called the Employees' State Insurance (Central) Second Amendment Rules, 1996.
2. They shall come into force from the 1st January, 1997.
3. Inthe Employees' State Insurance (Central) Rules, 1950 :—

(1) in rule 50 and in its proviso, for the words “three thousand”, the words “six thousand and five hundred”
shall be substituted;

(2) Inrule51, —
(i) in clause (a), for the words “four percent”, the words “four and three-fourth percent” shall be substituted,

(i) in clause (b), for the words “‘one and on¢ half percent’” the words “one and three-fourth percent” shall
be substituted,

(3) inrule 54, in the Table —

(i) against serial number 11 for the words and figures “Rs. 96 and above”, the words and figures “Rs. 96 and
above but below Rs. 116” shall be substituted;

(ii) after serial number 11 and entries relating thereto, the following serial numbers and entries shall be inserted,

namely :—

“12.  Rs, 116 and above but below Rs. 136 63.00
13, Rs. 136 and above but below Rs. 156 73.00
14. Rs. 156 and above but below Ra. 176 83.00
15. Rs. 176 and above but below Rs. 196 93.00

16. Rs. 196 and above but below Rs. 216 103.00
17. Rs. 216 and above but below Rs. 236 113.00

18. Rs. 236 and above 125.00"
[No. 8-38025/28/94-85.1]
R. K. SAIN], J. Secy.



4

‘THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT I—SkC, 3(i)]

FOOT NOTE :—The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part-II, Section -3, Sub-Section (i) vide Govern-
ment of India, Ministry of Labour Notification No. SRO 212, dated 22-6-1950, and subsequently amended by

-

I B e e T T —y
S e AT R S S i =

28]
=

el R

the following notifications :—

GSR No.,
GSR No.

GSR No.

GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No,
GSR No.
GSR No.

GSR No.

GSK No.

GSR No.

GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No.
GSR No,
GSR No.

80 dated 9-1-1960.
1200 dated 27-9-1960.
594 dated 29-3-1963.
240 dated 6-2-1964.

1834 dated 18-12-1964.

474 dated 19-3-1965,
1082 dated 29-6-1966.
545 dated 14-4-1967.
500 dated 6-3-1968.
677 dated 29-3-1968,
1106 dated 22-5-1968,

2113 dated 28-11-1968.

306 dated 7-3-1974.
1122 dated 1-10-1974,
56 dated 23-12-1976.
60 dated 5-1-1982.
129 dated 9-2-1987.
199 dated 6-3-1990,
76 dated 22-1-199].
368 dated 27-3-1992.
522 dated 16-11-1996.

Printed by the Manager, Govt. of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Dethi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054 — 1996



