
PT Fo Sto Weo-33004/99 

Ata 
Che Gazette of India 

EXTRAORDINARY 

WMT [I—avs 3—3q-WGvgs (i) 

PART —Section 3—-Sub-section (i) 

REGD. NO. D.1L.-33004/99 

  

  

  

  

  

wifrere 8 weiora 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

a. 387] ag facet, WHat, WHS 9, 2010/3TATE 18, 1932 . 

No. 387] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JULY 9, 2010/ASADHA 18, 1932 

Veterans sit wreafeer trea fatrama as “(3) art até wi sa-faftan (1) & atria faite 
srfergert aa eit at aagta area aT Sat at afte Tet 

SM al atta & ws St sed feat st stave S stax 
ag facet, 9 yong, 2010 wae"; 

aia, 594(st).—talferas ait orefers te (1) fafraa 10 8 sofas (4) 8 we at ate fea” 
fararen até afitfran, 2006 (2006 1 19) Bt URI 61 STI weal Ra ON “wae a area fea” wre Whreenfra 
wee wear at wat wet ET telferas ik wepfre te fru aT; 

ne we aire repos te afar Ca) fafran 14 @ 3u-fafras (1) HVS (H), (G) 

ate Gongita te evar er, Fa, eT aT ABR se) & fae frerfates oheeentia Gen we = fa wfaqa en) fafa, 2008 A deter aa oe Ferg “Tk, 
feu frafefies fafraa sara %, aad: — oe 

1. (1) fare tetferan ote oregfier te fafa (HRT feu: 
we (wafer ta agent faer, Frater, wares — @ wate ta & oftaer & anfie cer S <a wire 
TR ee & fare wise Se) Aetes fata, we at aan feu frere ais a uf a <a 
2010 Het ATE | wafer; 

(2) dared ws 4 at veRm st ate 8 wa Gi) wafer ta S aftaer S afte cers <a wferera 
a | a afte vere vlog dae at ae a fare Freres 

‘ais sat afer ar ate vfaera; 
2. Vetferaa sik wrenfaer the fara até (areata 

Ta ITE faor, frato, wae a fem we Ss faw Gi) wrpfee ta vitae & cite cea se Tara 
wifi een) fatter, 2008 F— BOO Se ee IRE 

fet art Testa wfaera 
(@) fafran s @ 3o-fafran (8) Fae fea” wal & 

za w]e wae at ate fer” we vfaeenfir fra (a) qed ya fer 
we; @ wefrr te & oftaer $ afte cer} ae vier 

(a) fafran 10 @ so-fatraa (3) & few frafetad aH al ae @ fee Frome aie =e uf a ate 
Yracenfid frat are, Ard: -— afer; 

2630 GI/2010 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY 

Gi) wafer te $ waer S afte cea S <a wher 
a after dare wfterd we at ga S fare fron 
ais at uf a areite via; 

Gi) waft tea é wkasr S afte wea} cae 
wierd o afi ce al ye am fee Fone ais 
cat Uf ar Tare Ufae; 

(1) Gad qa & faa: 

Prearet ais ct uit wr wae St ware” | 

[WL G. Wa-WeMA7/I1/8/2010] 

TH O. aaa, aaa 

we feauit—ae fatal et aah. 340(31), feria 
6, AR 2008 are sifirgfad fare wen em atk 
aaa FAA Ta. 802(31), fata 

19 Aaa, 2008 AM AHL. 769(31), 

fers 20 staqar, 2009 gr axitfa fran 
aT AT | 

PETROLEUM AND NATURAL GAS 

REGULAROTY BOARD 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 9th July, 2010 

G.S.R. 594(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred 
by Section 61 of the Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory 
Board Act, 2006 (19 of 2006), the Petroleum and Natural 
Gas Regulatory Board hereby makes the following 
regulations to amend the Petroleum and Natural Gas 
Regulatory Board (Authorizing Entities to Lay, Build, 
Operate or Expand Natural Gas Pipelines) Regulations, 2008, 
namely :— 

1. (1) These regulations may be called the Petroleum 
and Natural Gas Regulatory Board (Authorizing 
Entities to Lay, Build, Operate or Expand Natural 
Gas Pipelines) Amendment Regulations, 2010. 

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their 
publication in the Official Gazette. 

2. Inthe Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory Board 
(Authorizing Entities to Lay, Build, Operate or Expand 
Natural Gas Pipelines) Regulations, 2008,— 

(a) in sub-regulation (8) of regualation 5, for the words 
“sixty days”, the words “one hundred and twenty 
days” shall be substituted; 

[Part II—Sec. 3(i)] 

(b) for sub-regulation (3) of regualation 10, the 
following shall be substituted, namely :— 

“G) the entity shall submit Heads of Agreement or 
Memorandum of Understanding or both specified 
under sub-regulation (1) to the Board within a 
period of one hundred and eighty days of the 
date of issue of the authorisation”; 

(c) insub-regulation (4) of regulation 10, for the words 
“one hundred and twenty days”, the words “one 
hundred and eighty days” shall be substituted; 

(d) for clauses (a), (b) and (c) of sub-regulation 1 of 
regulation 14, the following shall be substituted, 
namely :— 

“(a) for the first default : 

(i) ten per cent of the amount of the performance 
bond for the default up to ten per cent of annual 
target of transporting natural gas; 

(i) twenty per cent of the amount of the performance 
bond for the default up to fifty per cent above ten 
per cent of annual target of transporting natural 

gas; 
(iii) twenty five per cent of the amount of the 

performance bond for the default above fifty per 
cent of annual target of transporting natural gas; 

(b) for the second default : 

(i) twenty per cent of the amount of the performance 
bond for the default up to ten per cent of annual 
target of transporting natural gas; 

(ii) forty per cent of the amount of the performance 
bond for the default up to fifty per cent above ten 
per cent of annual target of transporting natural 

_ gas; 
(iii) fifty per cent of the amount of the performance 

bond for the default above fifty per cent of annual 
target of transporting natural gas; 

(c) for the third default : 

one hundred per cent of the amount of the 
performance bond”. 

[F. No. S-Admn./II/8/2010] 
RATAN P. WATAL, Secy. 

Foot note.—Principal regulations were notified vide 
No. G.S.R. 340(E), dated 6th May, 2008 and 
subsequently amended vide G.S.R. 802(E), 
dated 19th November, 2008 and G.S.R. 769(E), 
dated 20th October, 2009. 

  

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.


