I Ho Eto WH0-33004/99

REGD. NO.D.1.-33004/99

Che Gazette of Iudia

EXTRAORDINARY

HAT [I—@ve 3—39-QUE (i)
PART II—Section 3——Sub-section (i)

TR | verive
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
| 387] w3 feoelt, ypRam, TS 9, 2010/3T9TE 18, 1932
No. 387] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JULY 9, 2010/ASADHA 18, 1932
erferam oiv wpfaw fw fafmams = “(3) e A = Su-faftm (1) ® st fafifde
sifireee IR Y 1w W 1 S H WHER S
T 9 aiE ¥ T | o BAl 9 ety B si
7§ fewett, 9 qaw, 2010 Y@ T
L, 594(e). e iR T e (m) Ffram 10 & s9-fafm (4) o o o e A
fafsrames o arfufEm, 2006 (2006 =1 19) 3 €4/ 61 g TR W T W U 9 o R " v ety
T vifErE w1 w0 gy veifemm ok Wk e o =g
faframs 91 waggn veifeam ik wrspfas
e B ESaa Fs s (=) faftam 14 = 3u-fafaw (1) & @vs (%), (|)
W (Wl T rggensA faem, fmtor, wrem o fawr e ot il
w0 = feru s o) fafmam, 2008 & WevT w0 2 (") e Freferfem sfeenfoa e s,
fir Frefafan fafem s 2, T — R b=
e S et e (%) oeh < = o+
arg (wrpfen T arvens e, frtor, wawem (i) Wl T S e % e we B < whew
71 freR 0 & o wiftrega ) e fafam, T B gH ® fou Feaea wie #5afr w5 5|
2010 @1 ST | wferer;
(2) ¥ TR T H ST FERE ) A Y Y (i) TR T witee @ Wit we = 7w v
ull - A rfys vam yfiwe 76 1 g% ® fog froames
q(E I T 1 Y yiaem;
2. Yy eIk Wi Ty faframes 9 (Tl X
o e faen, frain, wEe @ faer w9 @ fag (i) Wb g ® e # At v & T
Witrea wem) fafm, 2008 §— :?W@WWWﬁHE%WWW
Tfyr =1 =iy wfave
(%) fafrm 5 % 39-fafrm (3) ¥ “urs " vl @ I
WA W uE © A A" v whweefa fag (@) Tq <+ # fee
ST () wreBfirer Y o uftae % wiffer way & gw wfe
(@) fafm 10 % sy-fafmm (3) = foau fF=fatea T gF ® T e aiw %) of @ @

yitrenfun feen wQ, mE: — yfaerd;
2630 GI1/2010 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT II—SEC. 3(i)]

(i) THfe® Ta® uitasT ® aifife @ = <0 ghive
¥ atfss = e 7% w9 @ fae fae
1 T YR H1 T 9w

(i) WEfw e * et 3 i T = =y
wfier @ sifuss q% w1 g% @ forg Freaee i
w1 I=E i

(M whgF = fa .
Frsqrem =i =t uf¥n &1 & 9 giwe” |

[ €. T-TRm/11/8/2010]
WA 9. 9, 9fag

g fewut, @ fafmeml = wsf 340(31), foiw
6, % 2008 BN tfugfaa faman mar o1 3k
TeIvE TEE AL 802(3), T
19 %=, 2008 T WLHLF 769(=7),
&l 20 SRR, 2009 gr HYifE Rea
T o

PETROLEUM AND NATURAL GAS
REGULAROTY BOARD
NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 9th July, 2010

G.S.R. 594(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred
by Section 61 of the Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory
Board Act, 2006 (19 of 2006), the Petroleum and Natural
Gas Regulatory Board hereby makes the following
regulations to amend the Petroleum and Natural Gas
Regulatory Board (Authorizing Entities to Lay, Build,
Operate or Expand Natural Gas Pipelines) Regulations, 2008,
namely .—

L. (1) These regulations may be called the Petroleum
and Natural Gas Regulatory Board (Authorizing
Entities to Lay, Build, Operate or Expand Natural
Gas Pipelines) Amendment Regulations, 2010.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their
publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Inthe Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory Board
(Authorizing Entities to Lay, Build, Operate or Expand
Natural Gas Pipelines) Regulations, 2008,—

(a) insub-regulation (8) of regualation 5, for the words

“sixty days”, the words “one hundred and twenty
days” shall be substituted;

(b) for sub-regulation (3) of regualation 10, the
following shall be substituted, namely :—

“(3) the entity shall submit Heads of Agreement or
Memorandum of Understanding or both specified
under sub-regulation (1) to the Board within a
period of one hundred and eighty days of the
date of issue of the authorisation”;

(¢) insub-regulation (4) of regulation 10, for the words
“one hundred and twenty days”, the words “one
hundred and eighty days” shall be substituted;

(d) for clauses (a), (b) and (c) of sub-regulation 1 of
regulation 14, the following shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(a) for the first default :

( ten per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to ten per cent of annual
target of transporting natural gas;

(i) twenty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to fifty per cent above ten
per cent of annual target of transporting natural
gas;

(iii) twenty five per cent of the amount of the
performance bond for the default above fifty per
cent of annual target of transporting natural gas;

(b) for the second default :

( twenty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to ten per cent of annual
target of transporting natural gas;

(i) forty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default up to fifty per cent above ten
per cent of annual target of transporting natural

. gas;

(iif) fifty per cent of the amount of the performance
bond for the default above fifty per cent of annual
target of transporting natural gas;

(c) for the third default :

one hundred per cent of the amount of the
performance bond”.

[F. No. S-Admn./11/8/2010]
RATAN P. WATAL, Secy.
Foot note.—Principal regulations were notified vide
No. G.S.R. 340(E), dated 6th May, 2008 and
subsequently amended vide G.S.R. 802(E),
dated 19th November, 2008 and G.S.R. 769(E),

dated 20th October, 2009.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



